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MEETINGS & EVENTS
17th Annual NHJES
Conference  Attend the 17th
Joint Conference of the New
Hampshire Engineering
Societies (NHJES) . We are
using a new Format to add an
exciting new dimension to
conference experience.
Morning sessions will follow
our usual format with expert
speaker presentations on

MEMBER NEWS & ACTIVITIES

AI Policies in China  Our
Section Chair, Jim Isaak
shares thoughts from his
recent Oped that was
published by Union Leader
Manchester on AI Policies
and Guidelines trends in
China. 

IEEE NEW HAMPSHIRE NEWSLETTER
WISHING YOU A GLORIOUS FALL

SEP-OCT 2023
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current topics of interest.
New for the afternoon,
sessions will have the
morning speakers leading
hands-on-activities involving
relevant aspect(s) of their
presentations. Read the
Benefits of PE Licensing.
Register  18 October 2023
7:00 AM - 4 PM, Events
Center, Bedford NH. 

Future Thinking Scenarios:
Engineering, Computer
Science, Data Science & AI  
Joaquin of SUNY Buffalo
State University, will present
AI as an automation process
inspired by but to a large
extent without the goal of
creating a human intelligence

UNH IEEE Students Activities
Report  Nice Summary Report
on IEEE Student Club
activities at UNH 2022-
Todate.

Some Seed References for
Emerging AI Tech  Here is a
set of topical seed references
from our Section Chair, Jim
Isaak for getting started,
track and start your personal
exploration journeys. 

Election of 2024 IEEE NH
Officers  Read the detailed
annoucncement from
aboutthe upmconing
elections. Please consider
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clone. Dr. Joaquin will review
latest wave and examine
plausible scenarios in the job
market, engineering
education and industrial
practices. Register  20
October 2023 7:00 PM - 9:00
PM, Events Center, Bedford
NH. 

IEEE NH Member Elevation
And Networking Event   Have
you considered raising your
membership grade to a senior
member? Come and find out
more  29 Nov 2023 Time:
05:30 - 07:30 PM 204 A/B,
SETA IDE Engineering
Building, SNHU, Manchester
NH 

nominating yourself and/or
your colleagues to various
open positions. Deadline is
August 15, 2023.

IEEE New Hampshire
YouTube Channel 
Visit,Browse,Subscribe to our
You Tube channel for rich
multi-media assets covering a
range of interesting and
topical topics. Use New Items
for accessing items added
since the last Newsletter. For
questions Contact. 

IEEE NH Tech Policy Topics
Discussion Group and
Events Please read the full
details in the above link.
Please join the online group

https://events.vtools.ieee.org/event/register/374420
https://tinyurl.com/pt4nec9z
https://tinyurl.com/pt4nec9z
https://ieee-nh.org/rating/?article=RajElections&rating=5
https://ieee-nh.org/rating/?article=RajElections&rating=5
https://ieee-nh.org/newsletter-publisher/?ref=RajElections&feedback=suggestion
https://ieee-nh.org/newsletter-publisher/?ref=RajElections&feedback=suggestion
https://tinyurl.com/IEEENewHamp
https://tinyurl.com/IEEENewHamp
https://tinyurl.com/IEEENHNew
mailto:sridhar.raghavan@ieee.org
https://ieee-nh.org/rating/?article=utube&rating=5
https://ieee-nh.org/rating/?article=utube&rating=5
https://ieee-nh.org/newsletter-publisher/?ref=utube&feedback=suggestion
https://ieee-nh.org/newsletter-publisher/?ref=utube&feedback=suggestion
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jun2021/NHTechPolicyGroup.pdf
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jun2021/NHTechPolicyGroup.pdf
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jun2021/NHTechPolicyGroup.pdf
mailto:main+subscribe@TechPolicyTopics.groups.io


10/16/23, 12:43 AM Title:

file:///D:/AWebsites/IEEENH/NewsLetters/index100823.html 4/9

IEEE Conferences and Virtual
Events Calendar Browse for
Upcoming Conferences, Major
events and those available
on-demand. Also watch IEEE
TV For More..
MEMBER BENEFITS &
RESOURCES

IEEE Competitve
Advantage Watch how your
IEEE Peers and Colleagues
are reaping the benefits of
IEEE Membership, notably
competitive advantage for
successful careers. Subscribe
to IEEE Youtube Channel .

Keep Abreast of the Member
Benefits Use the new Global

where we will be developing
and announcing upcoming
activities. 

STEM Programs and
Resources in New
Hampshire This is a
comprehensive compilation
on pre-college STEM
programs and resources
available within New
Hampshire. Please share
these widely in your
communities, especially with
Parents and Teachers. Special
Thanks to our Webmaster
Alan Schechter.
LIFE AND LIGHTER VEIN CORNER
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Benefits Finder to become
aware of all your member
benfits tailored to your
location, career stage and
professional profile.

IEEE Computer Society
Learning Platform! Visit
frequently to keep pace with
technologies and trends that
are making the biggest
impact on the industry and
the society. 

JOBS & CAREERS
Nationwide Jobs
Computer Jobs 
NEIGHBORING SECTIONS

Joys & Savings: The Other
Side of Recycling  I was
happy to read the Consumer
Reports note on recycling
momentum. This inspired me
to share this personal staple.
Hope you enjoy such pieces,
contributed by our members,
sharing moments of Life,
even serious ones, in a light
hearted joyful manner. Look
forward to seeing Yours in a
future issue(s)

IEEE Puzzlers Join the IEEE
Recreational Math and
Puzzlers community on
Collabratec and enjoy the
puzzles and brain-teasers.
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IEEE Boston Section Their
Boston Reflector October
2023 .

IEEE Boston Section Video
Archives Watch the growing
library of interesting Video
presentations by Boston
Chapter. 

IEEE Maine Section 

IEEE Vermont Green
Mountain Section 
SOCIETIES AND CHAPTERS

IEEE Spectrum  Read on Next
Gen Nuclear Quest: New
Fusion Prospects Sans

GOVERNANCE
IEEE NH 2023 Officers 

Executive Committee Meeting
Summaries from IEEE NH
Section Chair.
Excomm Summaries
If you are an IEEE member
and would like to attend a
future meeting, please
contact Section Chair Jim
Isaak or Section Secretary
David Casper.
EDITOR'S CORNER
Earn Goodies Contribute
Articles, Newsletter Items,
and earn gifts, goodies, and
souvenirs. Coming Soon:
Participate in Teasers,
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Neutrons. How Generative AI
helped Me Imagine a Better
Robot. Solar-Powered Cars
where are they ? and more..

IEEE Computer Society  Read
Computing Edge October
2023 covering High
Performance Computing,
Cyber Security, Ethics and
History.

IEEE Robotics: Catchup on
Robotics News and Videos
IEEE Robotics Newsletter
September 2023. Watch The
Strandbeest a beautiful
monstrosity of robots and
more.

Puzzles, Surveys, Knowledge-
bits etc.

This Newsletter is a great
opportunity for members and
students to contribute
articles and/or share blogs
from your vantage. I
appreciate your Thoughts and
Contributions. Sri Raghavan.
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IEEE Humanitarian Activities
Board  Read their September
2023 Newsletter on
Sustainable Development and
Humanitarian Stories from
around the world.

IEEE TechEthics Updates
Learn about the IEEE
iniatives on the Ethics front:
Ethics Standards, Guidelines
for Ethically Aligned
Businesses, Digital Platforms
and Social Harms and more..

ENGAGE WITH US

IEEE-NH   Facebook   LinkedIn
IEEE-USA   Facebook   Twitter   Spectrum
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