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MEETINGS & EVENTS
Designing For Reliability With
Reliasoft Software  
This is a
joint event of IEEE Reliability
Chapters of Boston,
Providence, New Hampshire.
Semyon Mikheevskiy of
Hottinger, Bruel, & Kjaer, will
present how various stages of
Design for Reliability (DfR)
processes are implemented in
ReliaSoft software. Semyon
will demonstrate what the
DfR framework looks like,
where the methods and tools
fit in that standard work
process, and illustrate with a
case study on FMEA,
Telcordia, Accelerated life
testing and System reliability.
This Webinar is free and open
to all, but registration is
required.
 
9 Feb 2022, 11:00
AM to 12:00 PM EDT  
Virtual
Event
Register

IEEE Conferences and Virtual
Events Calendar Browse for
Upcoming Conferences, Major

MEMBER NEWS & ACTIVITIES
Serve as a Judge for the
Young Inventors Program  
This is great volunteering
opportunity and you can also
encourage and recognize
budding Young Inventors and
Innovators of New
Hamposhire high schools.
We, IEEE NH, are proud
sponsors of two awards for
students in this program.
Register yourself as IEEE-NH
or companyname/IEEE-NH. 
19-24 March 2022, 8:30-5:00
PM  
UNH and Virtual

Engaging with Student
Chapter IEEE at UNH Our
UNH Student Branch Chapter
is seeking engage with
alumni,
and other interested
IEEE members to provide
their perspectives on careers,
education and professional
experiences. Jim Isaak Chair
IEEE NH Section, welcomes
this as a great idea and
encourages members around
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https://events.vtools.ieee.org/m/300700
https://events.vtools.ieee.org/event/register/300700
https://www.ieee.org/conferences/
https://www.unh.edu/leitzel-center/form/register-judge-northern-new-england-invention-convention
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Dec2021/UNHMemberInvitation.pdf
file:///D:/AWebsites/IEEENH/NewsLetters/index.html
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022/index.html
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022//IEEENLJan2022.pdf
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022//VideoNL.html
https://meetings.vtools.ieee.org/meeting_view/index
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events and those available
on-demand. Also watch IEEE
TV For More..
MEMBER BENEFITS &
RESOURCES
IEEE Competitve
Advantage Watch how your
IEEE Peers and Colleagues
are reaping the benefits of
IEEE Membership, notably
competitive advantage for
successful careers.
Subscribe
to IEEE Youtube Channel .

Keep Abreast of Member
Benefits Use the new Global
Benefits Finder to become
aware of all your member
benfits tailored to your
location, career stage and
professional profile.

IEEE Computer Society
Learning Platform!
Visit
frequently to keep pace with
technologies and trends that
are making the biggest
impact on the industry and
the society.
JOBS & CAREERS
Nationwide Jobs

Computer Jobs 
NEIGHBORING SECTIONS
IEEE Boston Section Video

UNH Durham area as
well as
UNH Alumni to close the loop
with them. This is a great
way to help our Student
members, directly and
through our contacts and
provide them pathways to
internship and future
employments.

2022 Robotics and
Automation Society
Plans Read the note by Sri
Raghavan RAS Chair, on the
Webinar Plans for 2022. Sri
would like to hear your
thoughts and suggestion on
these and or allied topics.

Broadband Note to NH
Senators Read the note by
Jim Isaak IEEE NH Section
Chair to NH Senators
regarding Broadband in NH
and Policy Issues. Also read
the IEEE USA Broadband
Position Statement

Retaining Techies Through
Great Resignations Read the
note by Jim Isaak elaborating
his insightful Op-Ed article
published by Union Leader,
Manchester on 13 January
2022.

IEEE New Hampshire You

https://ieeetv.ieee.org/
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=aXLQ-hvRvB0&feature=youtu.be
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCqiraJWrp7rCzOZk4FCv3LA
https://www.ieee.org/membership/benefits/index.html
https://www.computer.org/education/courses
https://jobs.ieee.org/
http://computer.org/jobs
https://ieeeboston.org/webinar-video-archives/
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022/RasPlans2022.pdf
mailto:sridhar.raghavan@ieee.org
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022/JimNote2022.pdf
mailto:nhnl22@jimisaak.com
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022/RetainingTechies.pdf
mailto:nhnl22@jimisaak.com
https://tinyurl.com/IEEENewHamp
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Archives Watch the growing
library of interesting Video
presentations by Boston
Chapter. Notably watch the
videos of our own Paul Carr
on "Greener Power for More
Electrioc Vehicles" and
"Achieving a Net Zero Carbon
Future"

IEEE Boston Boston Reflector
Nov 2021

IEEE Maine Beacon December
2021
MISCELLANEOUS CORNER
Simple Delights We kick off
this Life/Humor/Arts Corner
for sharing lighter and joyful
moments of life, contributed
by our members. Look
forward to seeing yours for
the next issue(s)

IEEE Puzzlers Join the IEEE
Puzzlers on Collabratec and
enjoy doing Puzzles as well
as compete against others.
You will need to sign as an
IEEE Member

Tube Channel 
Visit,Browse,Subscribe to our
You Tube channel for current
and past Newsletters, the
video recordings of Various
Webinars/Events, Multi-
Media Technology Digests,
and Technical Presentations,
Video Logs and Artistic
Creations of our Members,
New England Sections. Any
questions Contact.

Social Dilemma
Documentary This Netflix
documentary documents
industry leaders/insiders
concerns about addiction and
the influence of free services
that combine big data,
artificial intelligence,
psychological research and
cute kittens to capture our
attention, develop detailed
profiles of every Internet
user, and then sell access to
influence these users to the
highest bidders.

IEEE NH Tech Policy Topics
Discussion Group and
Events Please read the full
deatils in the above link.
Please join the
online group
where we will be developing

https://ieeeboston.org/webinar-video-archives/
https://tinyurl.com/2p87mvj8
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022/SimpleDelights.pdf
https://ieee-collabratec.ieee.org/app/community/1343/IEEE-Puzzlers/activities?mkt_tok=NzU2LUdQSC04OTkAAAGByb9DUjWPdf78IH9H1nDUco7orzIF8FEErrWzUq86zrahoHPv0IkuVDCPCo8H_Mmf93HqOad93EXrV4-zrwsJJA6oNBKkRFfFLl9l9B6YcCE
https://tinyurl.com/IEEENewHamp
mailto:sridhar.raghavan@ieee.org
https://tinyurl.com/y444pd7s
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jun2021/NHTechPolicyGroup.pdf
mailto:main+subscribe@TechPolicyTopics.groups.io
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and announcing upcoming
activities.

Post-Pandemic Community
Touch-Reach Events
Planning  Please join the
discussions, follow, and
contribute to shape the ideas.
For questions Contact.

STEM Programs and
Resources in New
Hampshire This is a
comprehensive compilation
on pre-college STEM
programs and resources
available within New
Hampshire. Please share
these widely in your
communities, especially with
Parents and Teachers. Special
Thanks to our Webmaster
Alan Schechter.

Humanitarian Activities
Newsletter Read the
summary report by the Chair
of IEEE Humanitarian
Activities in 2021
GOVERNANCE
IEEE NH 2022 Officers 

Executive Committee Meeting
Summaries
from Jim Isaak,
IEEE NH Section Chair. 

Excomm Summaries


https://groups.io/g/NHIEEE-ExCom/wiki/26489
mailto:nhnl22@jimisaak.com
https://ieee-nh.org/member-resources/stem/#parents
mailto:schechter@computer.org
https://ewh.ieee.org/r1/new_hampshire/NLSri/Jan2022/HACSummary.pdf
https://ieee-nh.org/about-ieee/officers/
mailto:nhnl22@jimisaak.com
https://ieee-nh.org/member-resources/executive-summaries/
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If you are an IEEE member
and would like to attend a
future meeting, please
contact Section Chair Jim
Isaak or Section Secretary
David Casper.
EDITOR'S CORNER
This Newsletter is a great
opportunity for members and
students to contribute
articles and/or share blogs
from your vantage. I
appreciate your Thoughts and
Contributions.

Feedback Request from Sri
Raghavan, the NewsLetter
Editor.
Hope these
Newsletters are meeting your
needs and expectations.
Appreciate your Thoughts.
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